
 Community Planning & Permitting 
Courthouse Annex  •  2045 13th Street  •  Boulder, Colorado  80302  •  Tel: 303-441-3930 
Mailing Address:  P.O. Box 471  •  Boulder, Colorado 80306  •  www.BoulderCounty.org 

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS HEARING 
BOULDER COUNTY, COLORADO 

 THURSDAY, JUNE 22, 2023 AT 9:00 A.M. 

All commissioners’ public hearings and meetings will be offered in a hybrid format where 
attendees can join through Zoom or in-person at the Boulder County Courthouse, 3rd Floor, 1325 
Pearl Street, Boulder. There will also be a kiosk located in the lobby of the 3rd Floor to sign up for 
in-person public comment. For questions regarding in-person hearings, please email Brianna 
Barber at bbarber@bouldercounty.org or call 303-441-3500. 

HEARING PACKET 

PACKET CONTENTS 

ITEM            PAGE # 
Updated Fire Code Review Committee Resolution 2023-039 1-4
Updated Fire Code Review Committee Bylaws          5-6
FCRC-23-0001 - Lyons FPD - Staff Recommendations              7-8
Revised Lyons FPD Adopting Resolution 2023-004    9-68
Map of Lyons FPD Tax District          69 
Staff Report for May 23, 2023, FCRC Hearing       70-71
Confirmation Letter from Lyons FPD Board Accepting Revisions            72-73
Referral Responses         74-75
Minutes from FCRC May 23, 2023, Hearing       76-78
FCRC-23-0002 Mtn View FPD - Staff Recommendations          79-80
Mountain View Fire District Adoption Resolution 2023-2           81-89
Map of Mountain View FPD Tax District            90-91
Staff Report for May 23, 2023, FCRC Hearing       92-93
Referral and Public Responses      94-96

mailto:bbarber@bouldercounty.org


RESOLUTION NO. 2023-039 

ESTABLISHING A FIRE CODE REVIEW PROCESS FOR THE UNINCORPORATED AREAS OF BOULDER COUNTY 
AND REPEALING AND REPLACING RESOLUTION NO. 82-41 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Boulder County has authority pursuant to CRS 
1973, 32-1-1002(l)(d), as amended, to approve or deny those fire codes adopted by fire protection 
districts within the unincorporated areas of Boulder County; and 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Boulder County held a meeting on July 19, 
1982, concerning the establishment of a Fire Code Review Committee for the purpose of facilitating the 
procedural process in approving or denying those fire codes adopted by fire protection districts within 
the unincorporated areas of Boulder County; and 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Boulder County has determined that the 
establishment of a Fire Code Review Committee for the purpose of expediting the review process of 
those fire codes that have been adopted by various special districts within the unincorporated areas of 
Boulder County is in the interest of the public health, safety, and welfare of the present and future 
inhabitants of the County of Boulder, State of Colorado; and 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Boulder County held a meeting on June 22, 
2023, concerning amendments to the procedural process for approving or denying fire codes adopted 
by fire protection districts within the unincorporated areas of Boulder County. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that Resolution No. 82-41 adopted on July 28, 1982, is 
hereby repealed and re-enacted with the following provisions concerning the review process for fire 
codes within the unincorporated areas of Boulder County and the establishment of a Fire Code Review 
Committee. 

SECTION 1. DECLARATION OF POLICY 

The County of Boulder recognizes the importance of adopting and enforcing fire codes within the 
unincorporated areas of Boulder County. The County encourages fire protection districts to adopt fire 
codes consistent with nationally recognized good practice for the safeguarding of life and property from 
the hazards of fire and in the use of buildings and premises, 

1.1 Fire Protection Districts - Additional Powers and Duties: 

The State of Colorado in recognizing the need for fire codes has provided Fire Protection District 
Boards with the authority to adopt and enforce fire codes under the provision of 32-1-
1002(1)(d) CRS 1973, (as amended). 

1.2 Board of County Commissioners to Act on Fire Codes: 

No such fire code adopted by the Board of a Fire Protection District shall apply within the 
unincorporated areas of said district within Boulder County unless the Board of County 
Commissioners adopts a resolution stating that such code or specific portions thereof shall be 
applicable within its boundaries. 

1



(a) The Fire Code Review Committee shall make recommendations to the Board of 
County Commissioners as contained in Section 3, 3.5; Review Process of Fire Codes. 

 

SECTION 2. ESTABLISHMENT OF FIRE CODE REVIEW COMMITTEE 

2.1 Membership:     The Fire Code Review Committee of the County of Boulder shall consist of five 
members chosen by the Board of County Commissioners who shall be residents of the County of 
Boulder and who shall have a knowledge of building construction and/or fire protection. The term of 
office, vacancy and removal shall be determined by the Board of County Commissioners. 

2.2 Powers and Duties:     The Fire Code Review Committee shall adopt rules and regulations 
governing its procedures, upon approval, by the Board of County Commissioners of Boulder County, and 
shall hold a public hearing as necessary, for the purpose of making recommendations to the Board of 
County Commissioners of Boulder County concerning acceptance or rejection of the fire codes 
submitted by special districts in the unincorporated areas of Boulder County as contained in Section 3.5 
herein. 

 

SECTION 3. REVIEW PROCESS OF FIRE CODES 

3.1 Receipt of Request for Acceptance of a Fire Code: 

Upon the receipt of a request for acceptance of a fire code the Secretary to the Fire Code 
Review Committee shall designate the hearing date of the Fire Code Review Committee at which the 
request will be considered. 

(a) Requests for approval of a Fire Code must be received by the Secretary to the 
Fire Code Review Committee at least four (4) weeks prior to scheduling of a hearing 
date. 

3.2 Referral of Submitted Fire Codes:     Upon receipt of a request for approval of a fire code, the 
Community Planning & Permitting Department shall refer the submitted fire code to the following 
offices or agencies for review and recommendations within three (3) working days of the receipt of 
same: 

County Attorney County Sheriff District Attorney 

Boulder County Fire Fighter's Association 

Any county (counties) adjacent to the Fire Protection District 

Any municipality within 2·miles of the Fire Protection District boundaries. 

Other agencies as may be deemed necessary by the County or the District. 

Each member of the Fire Code Review Committee. 

(a) All referral agencies, excluding the Fire Code Review Committee, shall be 
required to return their respective comments and recommendations to the 

2



Community Planning & Permitting Department within seven (7) days of the 
receipt of same. 

(b) All comments and recommendations received by the Community Planning & 
Permitting Department from the various referral officials or agencies shall be 
promptly forwarded to the Fire Code Review Committee by the Community 
Planning & Permitting Department prior to the Fire Code Review Committee 
hearing at which such request for approval of a fire code is to be considered. 

3.3 Review of Fire Codes:     Through the referral process of Section 3.2 the County shall solicit 
comments and recommendations concerning the merits of the code and its compatibility with the 
Boulder County Building Code. 

3.4 Advertising for Fire Code Review Committee Hearing:     Notice of all hearings of the Fire Code 
Review Committee shall be advertised at least seven (7) days prior to the hearing in a newspaper of 
general circulation in the County of Boulder. 

3.5 Fire Code Review Committee Makes Recommendation on Fire Codes:     The Fire Code Review 
Committee shall hold a public hearing for the purpose of making recommendations to the Board of 
County Commissioners, concerning acceptance or rejection of the fire codes submitted by special 
districts in the unincorporated areas of Boulder County. Public testimony and comments by the 
requesting Fire Protection District will be taken into consideration at the hearing. 

(a) The Fire Code Review Committee may take action in the form of a 
recommendation to the Board of County Commissioners for acceptance or 
rejection of the fire code in question or the Fire Code Review Committee may 
table any request for approval of a fire code for further action. 

3.6 Scheduling of Public Hearing Before Board of County Commissioners:     Upon recommendation 
being made by the Fire Code Review Committee pursuant to public hearing, said recommendation in the 
form of a certified resolution shall be forwarded to the Board of County Commissioners within five (5) 
days after the date of the hearing at which the Fire Code Review Committee's recommendation was 
made. Within two (2) days of the receipt of the Fire Code Review Committee's recommendation by the 
Board of County Commissioners, the Secretary to the Fire Code Review Committee will then schedule a 
public hearing before the Board of County Commissioners. 

3.7 Advertising for Public Hearing Before the Board of County Commissioners:     Notice of hearing 
before the Board of County Commissioners for consideration of requests for approval of fire codes shall 
be advertised at least seven (7) days prior to the hearing in a newspaper of general circulation in the 
County of Boulder. 

3.8 Commissioners to Take Action on Fire Codes:     The Board of County Commissioners shall hold a 
public hearing to take action upon the submitted fire code. The Board of County Commissioners shall 
accept or reject all or portions of the fire code submitted by the Fire Protection District or continue the 
hearing for a reasonable time. The Board of County Commissioners shall adopt a resolution concerning 
its action regarding the fire code. A copy of said resolution shall be sent to the Fire Protection District 
Board. Any such approval of a district's fire code or portions thereof merely makes that code 
enforceable by the district pursuant to law. No such approval by the Board of County Commissioners 

3



creates any additional authority in the district, its officers, members, or agents, nor does such approval 
make the Board of County Commissioners responsible for the actions of the district in any way. Any 
provisions of such code which purport to create more immunity from liability for the district or its 
members than they are entitled to by law, or which purports to create liability in the county or its 
employees which is not otherwise based in law are not hereby ratified or acknowledged by the Board of 
County Commissioners. 

3.9 Amendments to Fire Codes:     From time to time, fire districts may desire to amend or update 
their fire codes. Such changes shall be sent to the Board of County Commissioners for action pursuant to 
3.8 above. Minor amendments or updates will not require repetition of the entire review process, while 
major amendment shall be subject to referral and review. 

SECTION 4. REVIEW OF BUILDING PERMITS 

4.1 Notification of Fire Department: The Special District Act provides for enforcement of fire codes 
through inspections. Further, the statutes do not provide any authority for the County to deny building 
permits when the plans do not comply with the codes adopted by the fire district. Therefore, the County 
Building Division shall request the review of all building permit applications other than those for 
individual dwelling units and their accessory structures by the applicable fire department in order to 
apprise the applicant of the provisions of the fire code. 

SECTION 5. ENFORCEMENT OF FIRE CODE 

5.1 Recommended Procedures:     With respect to 32-1-1002(3)(c) and 32-1-1002(5) C.R.S. 1973, (as 
amended), the procedures for obtaining compliance with fire codes, as adopted by the Boulder County 
Fire Fighter's Association and attached hereto are recommended for use by the Fire Protection Districts. 

5.2 District Attorney Shall Prosecute:     Under the provisions of 32-1-1002(5) C.R.S. 1973, (as 
amended), the District Attorney shall prosecute any violation of the Fire Districts' fire code. 

Adopted this ____ day of ______, 20___ by the Board of County Commissioners.

Board of County Commissioners 

_______________________________ 

_______________________________ 

_______________________________

Attest:

___________________________ 
Clerk to the Board

4



BOULDER COUNTY FIRE CODE REVIEW COMMITTEE BY-LAWS 

Section 1 PURPOSE 

The Boulder County Fire Code Review Committee was established by the Board of County 
Commissioners of Boulder County and is to operate pursuant to Resolution 2023-039. The purpose of 
the Boulder County Fire Code Review Committee is to make recommendations to the Board of County 
Commissioners of Boulder County concerning acceptance or rejection of the fire codes submitted by 
Special Districts in the unincorporated areas of Boulder County pursuant to the provisions of 32-1-
1002(1)(d) C.R.S. 1973, (as amended). 

Section 2 MEETINGS 

Meetings of the Boulder County Fire Code Review Committee shall be conducted as necessary to fully 
consider particular fire codes proposed for approval. At such meetings, the committee shall consider all 
matters brought before it pursuant to Section 3 of Resolution 2023-039. All such hearings of the Fire 
Code Review Committee shall be for the purpose of making a recommendation to the Board of County 
Commissioners. To carry out this purpose thoroughly, all meetings shall be open to the public and the 
applicant Fire Protection District shall be given full opportunity to present relevant comments and 
testimony at each hearing. If a proposed fire code adoption is referred to the Fire Code Review 
Committee for any particular meeting, the secretary shall so notify all members of date, time, and 
location of hearing. 

Section 3 SPECIAL MEETINGS 

Special meetings of the Fire Code Review Committee may be held at any time and place designated by 
the chair, or in their place, the vice chair. Notice of such special meeting shall be given pursuant to 
Section 3.4 of Resolution No. 23-XX. 

Section 4 QUORUM AND VOTING 

A quorum shall be three members of the Fire Code Review Committee and no action shall be approved 
without a majority vote of those voting members present. Evidence shall not be presented to the 
committee unless a quorum is present. 

Section 5 CERTIFICATION OF ACTION 

The Fire Code Review Committee shall certify its recommendations to the Board of County 
Commissioners within five (5) days after the date of the hearing at which the recommendation was 
made. 

Section 6 MINUTES 

The Fire Code Review Committee shall keep minutes of its proceedings showing the vote(s) of each 
member upon each question and the reasons for any members’ absences or failure to vote. The 
committee shall keep records of its meetings, hearings, and other official actions, all of which shall be 
filed in the office of the Community Planning & Permitting Department, Building Division and shall be 
open to the public for inspection. 

 

5



Section 7 OFFICERS 

The officers of the Fire Code Review Committee shall be a chair, a vice chair, and a secretary. The chair 
and vice chair shall be elected by the committee for a term of one year. The chair shall preside at all 
hearings of the committee and may call special hearings in accordance with these by-laws. During the 
absence of the chair, the vice chair shall perform all the duties and be subject to all the responsibilities 
of the chair. The Chief Building Official of the Community Planning & Permitting Department, Building 
Division, shall serve as secretary of the Fire Code Review Committee. The secretary shall keep minutes 
of all the meetings of the board, give all notices required by law or by these by-laws, prepare the agenda 
for all meetings of the committee and be custodian of the committee records. 

Section 8 AMENDING THE BY-LAWS 

A hearing to amend these by-laws may be held at any meeting of the Fire Code Review Committee. 
Adoption of any proposed amendments shall be by a vote of a majority of the committee members 
present and shall be subject to approval by the Board of County Commissioners. 

Approved and adopted by the Boulder County Fire Code Review Committee this 23rd day of May, 2023. 

Attest: 

_____________________________________________ 

Ron Flax, Secretary to the Fire Code Review Committee 

Approved and adopted by the Boulder County Board of Commissioners this _____ day of ___________, 
20___. 

_____________________________________________ 

_____________________________________________ 

_____________________________________________ 

Attest: 

_______________________________________ 

Clerk to the Board 

6



  
 

 
 

 

Claire Levy County Commissioner     Marta Loachamin County Commissioner    Ashley Stolzmann County Commissioner 
 

Community Planning & Permitting 
Courthouse Annex  •  2045 13th Street  •  Boulder, Colorado  80302  •  Tel: 303.441.3930 
Mailing Address:  P.O. Box 471  •  Boulder, Colorado 80306  •  www.bouldercounty.org 
 

Building Safety & Inspection Services  
 

 
BOULDER COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  

PUBLIC HEARING  
DOCKET #FCRC-23-0001 

LYONS FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT FIRE CODE  
(2021 IFC) 

 
Thursday, June 22, 2023 @ 9:00 AM 

 
 All commissioners’ public hearings and meetings will be offered in a hybrid 
format where attendees can join through Zoom or in-person at the Boulder 

County Courthouse, 3rd Floor, 1325 Pearl Street, Boulder. There will also be a 
kiosk located in the lobby of the 3rd Floor to sign up for in-person public 

comment. For questions regarding in-person hearings, please email Brianna 
Barber at bbarber@bouldercounty.org or call 303-441-3500. 

 
 

Staff: Ron Flax, Chief Building Official, Deputy Director of Community Planning & 
Permitting – Permits and Licensing, Secretary to the Fire Code Review Committee 
 
The subject of this hearing is acceptance of the proposed Lyons Fire Protection District Fire 
Code for administration by the Lyons Fire Protection District. 
 
The Lyons Fire Protection District protects approximately 6200 citizens living in an area of 
66 square miles. The district includes approximately 40 square miles in northern Boulder 
County and 26 square miles in southern Larimer County.  In addition to the Town of Lyons, 
the district includes multiple surrounding neighborhoods of unincorporated Boulder and 
Larimer counties. These neighborhoods include Lyons Park Estates, Apple Valley Road, 
Longmont Dam Road, Spring Gulch, Blue Mountain, X-Bar 7 Ranch, Steamboat Valley 
Road, Eagle Ridge, Stone Canyon, Dakota Ridge Road, as well as the land several miles up 
both the North St. Vrain and South St Vrain Rivers, along Highway 7 and Highway 36.  
 
Map #1 (attached) represents the approximate boundaries of the district.   
 
Staff has the following comments on the proposed fire code adoption: 
 
2021 Edition.  Adopting the latest edition of the Fire Code is strongly encouraged.  The 
Lyons FPD is currently on the 2015 edition and this update to the 2021represents an 
important update for the district and will strengthen alignments between the Lyons FPD the 
surrounding fire districts as well as improving alignments between the district and 
Unincorporated Boulder County.   
 

7

mailto:bbarber@bouldercounty.org


General Comments. Most of the proposed 2021 IFC adoption accepts the IFC as published 
by the International Code Council.  There are significant local amendments which introduce 
requirements that regulate safety during alcoholic beverage production as well as the 
cultivation and processing of cannabis.  These topics are not comprehensively addressed in 
the nationally published code.  The text for these sections appears to be largely adapted from 
the City and County of Denver’s Fire Code and is intended to address rapidly growing 
industries.  There is clear evidence that we are experiencing local growth in these industries 
at a rate that is considerably faster than most of the country, and these codes are proactive 
with regard to these potential hazards.  These amendments are consistent with the fire 
district’s previous adoption of the 2015 IFC, as well as the adoption language of several 
regional Fire District requirements.   

Other proposed amendments appear to be largely clarifying administrative provisions and 
are also consistent with past Fire Code Adoptions and regional Fire District requirements. 

Review and Recommendations from the Fire Code Review Committee:  On May 23rd, 
the Fire Code Review Committee met and discussed the proposed Lyons Fire Protection 
District’s proposed text.  The committee identified a number of minor clerical and editorial 
changes that they recommended be corrected.  These were considered minor changes and 
did not involve any matters that substantially changed the intent of the proposed code.  The 
committee voted unanimously to recommend to the Board of County Commissioners that 
the proposed Lyons Fire Protection District Fire Code be ACCEPTED for administration by 
the district in those portions of unincorporated Boulder County that lie within the boundaries 
of the fire protection district, with the edits suggested by the committee.  Since this meeting, 
the Lyons Fire Protection District has revised their proposed code in accordance with the 
recommendations of the committee.  The revised document is attached.  

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:  Staff recommends that the proposed Lyons Fire 
Protection District Fire Code be ACCEPTED for administration by the district in those 
portions of unincorporated Boulder County that lie within the boundaries of the fire 
protection district.   

Attachments:   Revised Lyons FPD Fire Code Adopting Resolution 2023-004 
Map of Lyons FDP Tax district. 
Staff Report for the May 23rd Fire Code Review Committee Meeting. 
Confirmation Letter from the Lyons Fire Protection District Board of 
Directors accepting the revised Fire Code adoption document. 
Minutes from the Fire Code Review Committee May 23rd Meeting.  

8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



23



24



25



26



27



28



29



30



31



32



33



34



35



36



37



38



39



40



41



42



43



44



45



46



47



48



49



50



51



52



53



54



55



56



57



58



59



60



61



62



63



64



65



66



67



68



25

8

9

22

27

14

33

19

1210

11

3

32

10

3

16

24

18

10

11

6

12

8

20

5

27

33

19

18

88

13

1

15

23

10

1

15

21

25

4

3

24

7

28

56

2

8

23

8
11

7

16

10

7

LARIMER COUNTY

4

30

35

1

4

22

7

13

6

26

12

3

15

2

77

5

9

20

29

36

28

4

29

3

34

17

14

31

17

34

21

12

34

6

9

32

2

9

27

2

5

31

1

35

26

22

10

30

11

3

36

66

SO
UT
H

SAINT

VR

AIN

DR

NO
RTH

SA
INT

VRAIN DR

N
FO

OT
HI
LL
S

HW
Y

NELS
ON

RD

SAINTVRAIN RD

HYGIENE RD

AP
PL

E
VA

LL
EY

R
D

AN
TELO

PEDR

HIGHLANDDR

NO
RTH

D
AKO

TA
RIDGE RD

BLU
E

M
O
U
N
TAIN

RD

N
59
TH

ST

OLD
SA
INTVRAINRD

ROGERS RD

LONGMONT DAM RD

VEST
ALRD

N

53
R
D

ST

N

55
TH

ST

N 51
ST

ST

NOLAN DR

HIGHLAND DR N 51ST ST

N

49
TH

ST

CONIFER

HILL

RDSPRUCEDR

RI

VE
RS

IDE

DR

R
ED

 G
U
LC

H
 R
D

.

.

.

Lyons

Allenspark Fire
Protection
District

Berthoud Fire
District

Hygiene
Fire

District

Lefthand Fire
District

Lyons Fire
District

Pinewood
Springs Fire

Sources: Esri, Airbus DS, USGS, NGA, NASA, CGIAR, N Robinson, NCEAS, NLS, OS, NMA, Geodatastyrelsen, Rijkswaterstaat, GSA, Geoland, FEMA, Intermap and the GIS user
community, Sources: Esri, HERE, Garmin, FAO, NOAA, USGS, © OpenStreetMap contributors, and the GIS User Community

Lyons FPD

Doc Path: V:\prjlu\2020\MapRequestLyonsFPDBoundary_GIS-20-0016\LyonsFPD.aprx

0 0.6 1.2
Miles

Date: 2/27/2020

The user agrees to all Terms of Use set forth
by Boulder County. For Terms of Use, please
visit: www.bouldercounty.org/mapdisclaimer

Area of Detail

Lyons

Nederland

Ward

Jamestown

Boulder

Longmont

Erie

Louisville
Superior

wtodacheene

Municipalities

County Boundary

Pinewood Springs FD

Lyons FD

Lefthand FD

Hygiene FD

Berthoud FD

Allenspark FPD

Fire Protection Districts

69



  
 

 
 

 

Claire Levy County Commissioner     Marta Loachamin County Commissioner    Ashley Stolzmann County Commissioner 
 

Community Planning & Permitting 
Courthouse Annex  •  2045 13th Street  •  Boulder, Colorado  80302  •  Tel: 303.441.3930 
Mailing Address:  P.O. Box 471  •  Boulder, Colorado 80306  •  www.bouldercounty.org 
 

Building Safety & Inspection Services  
 

 
BOULDER COUNTY FIRE CODE REVIEW COMMITTEE  

DOCKET #FCRC-23-0001 
PUBLIC HEARING 

LYONS FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT FIRE CODE  
(2021 IFC) 

 
Tuesday, May 23, 2023 at 3pm 

 
 This Fire Code Review Committee hearings and meeting will be offered in a 
hybrid format where attendees can join through Teams or in-person at the 
Boulder County Courthouse Annex, 2nd Floor, 2045 13th Street, Boulder.  

 
Information regarding how to participate is available on the Fire Code 

Review Committee webpage at https://www.bouldercounty.gov/property-and-
land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-committee/. 

 
 

Staff: Ron Flax, Chief Building Official, Secretary to the Fire Code Review Committee 
 

 
The Lyons Fire Protection District protects approximately 6200 citizens living in an area of 
66 square miles. The district includes approximately 40 square miles in northern Boulder 
County and 26 square miles in southern Larimer County.  In addition to the Town of Lyons, 
the district includes multiple surrounding neighborhoods of unincorporated Boulder and 
Larimer counties. These neighborhoods include Lyons Park Estates, Apple Valley Road, 
Longmont Dam Road, Spring Gulch, Blue Mountain, X-Bar 7 Ranch, Steamboat Valley 
Road, Eagle Ridge, Stone Canyon, Dakota Ridge Road, as well as the land several miles up 
both the North St. Vrain and South St Vrain Rivers, along Highway 7 and Highway 36.  
 
Map #1 (attached) represents the approximate boundaries of the district.   
 
Staff has the following comments on the proposed fire code adoption: 
 
2021 Edition.  Adopting the latest edition of the Fire Code is strongly encouraged.  The 
Lyons FPD is currently on the 2015 edition and this update to the 2021represents an 
important update for the district and will strengthen alignments between the Lyons FPD the 
surrounding fire districts as well as improving alignments between the district and 
Unincorporated Boulder County.   
 
General Comments. Most of the proposed 2021 IFC adoption accepts the IFC as published 
by the International Code Council.  There are significant local amendments which introduce 

70



requirements that regulate safety during alcoholic beverage production as well as the 
cultivation and processing of cannabis.  These topics are not comprehensively addressed in 
the nationally published code.  The text for these sections appears to be largely adapted from 
the City and County of Denver’s Fire Code and is intended to address rapidly growing 
industries.  There is clear evidence that we are experiencing local growth in these industries 
at a rate that is considerably faster than most of the country, and these codes are proactive 
with regard to these potential hazards.  These amendments are consistent with the fire 
district’s previous adoption of the 2015 IFC, as well as the adoption language of several 
regional Fire District requirements.   
 
Other proposed amendments appear to be largely clarifying administrative provisions and 
are also consistent with past Fire Code Adoptions and regional Fire District requirements. 
 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION:  Staff recommends that the Fire Code Review Committee 
recommend to the Board of County Commissioners that the proposed Lyons Fire Protection 
District Fire Code be ACCEPTED for administration by the district in those portions of 
unincorporated Boulder County that lie within the boundaries of the fire protection district.   
 
 
Attachments: Lyons FPD Fire Code Adopting Resolution 2023-003 
  Map of Lyons FDP Tax district. 
 

71



72



73



  
 

 
 

 

Claire Levy County Commissioner     Marta Loachamin County Commissioner     Ashley Stolzmann County Commissioner 

Community Planning & Permitting 
Courthouse Annex • 2045 13th Street • Boulder, Colorado 80302 
Mailing Address: P.O. Box 471 • Boulder, Colorado 80306   
303-441-3930 • www.BoulderCounty.gov 
 

MEMO  
 
TO: Curtis Johnson, Boulder County Sheriff  
FROM:  Ron Flax, Chief Building Official   
DATE: May 31, 2023     
RE: Fire Code Review Committee Public Hearing   
  
Request:  Lyons Fire District requests adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code and 
Amendments 
 
A public hearing of the Boulder County Fire Code Review Committee has been held to consider a 
request by the Lyons Fire Protection District to adopt the 2021 International Fire Code and 
Amendments.   
The Community Planning & Permitting Department staff and County Commissioners value 
comments from individuals and agencies.  Please check the appropriate response below and submit 
to Ron Flax at rflax@bouldercounty.org or mail to: 
  
 Community Planning & Permitting Department 

Ron Flax, Boulder County Chief Building Official  
 P.O. Box 471 
 Boulder, CO. 80306 
  
Please respond within seven days of the date of this referral.  Late responses will be reviewed as 
the process permits.  All comments will be made part of the public record and given to the 
applicant.   
Only a portion of the submitted documents may have been enclosed.  If you would like additional 
information, you are welcome to review the entire file on our Fire Code Review Committee website 
at https://bouldercounty.gov/property-and-land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-
committee/#:~:text=The%20Fire%20Code%20Review%20Committee,districts%20to%20enforce%2
0these%20codes. 
If you have any questions regarding this application, please contact me at 720-564-2643. 
 
Thank you, 
Ron Flax, Boulder County Chief Building Official 
 
Please return responses to the above address by DATE 
__X__ We have reviewed the proposal and have no conflicts. 
_____ Letter is enclosed. 
 
Signed________________________________    
Printed Name_Curtis Johnson______________     
 
Agency or Address __Boulder County Sheriff__________________________ 

74

mailto:rflax@bouldercounty.org
https://bouldercounty.gov/property-and-land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-committee/#:%7E:text=The%20Fire%20Code%20Review%20Committee,districts%20to%20enforce%20these%20codes
https://bouldercounty.gov/property-and-land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-committee/#:%7E:text=The%20Fire%20Code%20Review%20Committee,districts%20to%20enforce%20these%20codes
https://bouldercounty.gov/property-and-land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-committee/#:%7E:text=The%20Fire%20Code%20Review%20Committee,districts%20to%20enforce%20these%20codes


75



  
 

 
 

 

Claire Levy County Commissioner     Marta Loachamin County Commissioner     Ashley Stolzmann County Commissioner 

Community Planning & Permitting 
Courthouse Annex • 2045 13th Street • Boulder, Colorado 80302 
Mailing Address: P.O. Box 471 • Boulder, Colorado 80306   
303-441-3930 • www.BoulderCounty.gov 
 

Boulder County 
Fire Code Review Committee 

 
Minutes 

May 23, 2023 
3:00 PM 

2045 13th Street, Boulder, CO 80302 
Hybrid Hearing via Microsoft Teams 

 
On May 23rd, the Boulder County Fire Code Review Committee met to discuss two fire code 
adoption requests: the adoption and amendments of the 2021 International Fire Code by Lyons 
Fire Protection District AND the adoption and amendments of the 2021 International Fire Code 
by Mountain View Fire Protection District. The committee also made some minor updates to the 
committee bylaws.   
 
The meeting convened at 3:05 pm and was recorded.  This recording is available upon request.   
 
Board Members Present: Michelle Kelly (in-person), Dean Rogers (virtual), Doug Saba (in-
person), and Pat Noyes (virtual). 
 
Staff Present: Ron Flax (Chief Building Official/CP&P Deputy Director – in-person), Kathy 
Gissel (Permit & License Operations Manager – in-person), Liana James (County Attorney – 
virtual) and Erica Rogers (County Attorney - virtual). 
 
Interested Others: Steve Pischke (in-person) and Jeff Webb (in-person). 
 

1. Call to Order 
Ron Flax called the meeting to order. 
 

2. Appointing Members of the Committee 
a. Chair: Dean Rogers was nominated by Doug Saba, seconded by Michelle Kelly, 

and approved by unanimous vote. 
b. Vice-Chair: Doug Saba was nominated by Michelle Kelly, seconded by Pat 

Noyes, and approved by unanimous vote. 
 

3. Past Minutes 
Approval of Fire Code Review Committee minutes from May 24, 2022 (Berthoud and 
Nederland Adoption of Fire Codes). 
Motion: Michelle Kelly moved to approve the minutes 
Second: Doug Saba 
Vote: Motion approved by unanimous vote 
 
 

76



 
4. Updates to Resolution 82-41 and Fire Code Review Committee By-Laws 

Kathy Gissel presented suggested updates to the resolution and by-laws which include adoption 
resolutions to be submitted to the department who oversees the FCRC, rather than to the 
commissioner’s office; updating the name of the department that oversees the FCRC from Land 
Use to Community Planning & Permitting due to county reorganization in 2020; and changed 
when the hearings are held from every 3rd Thursday of every month to an as needed basis only. 
Motion: Doug Saba moved to approve the updates 
Second: Dean Rogers 
Vote: Motion approved by unanimous vote 
 

5. Public Hearing 
 
FCRC-23-0001 – LYONS FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT REQUESTS TO ADOPT 
AND AMEND THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 
 
The Fire Code Review Committee discussed the text of the proposed amendments contained 
within the Lyons Fire Protection District adoption resolution.  There were a few concerns raised 
in terms of wording, numbering of sections, and adding a specific number of business days in 
section 8, subsection 111.  
 
Steve Pischke agreed to take the edits back to the Lyons Board, and with their Board’s approval 
of the edits, will then resubmit their requested adoption to Boulder County. The Committee 
agreed that they would not need to review revised Lyons Resolution if the edits aligned with the 
committee’s suggestions.   
 
Motion: Michelle Kelly motioned to recommend to the Board of County Commissioners that 
the proposed Lyons Fire Protection District Fire Code be ACCEPTED for administration by the 
district in those portions of unincorporated Boulder County that lie within the boundaries of the 
fire protection district, with the edits suggested by the committee. 
Second: Dean Rogers  
Vote:     Motion approved unanimously 
 
FCRC-23-0002 – MOUNTAIN VIEW FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT REQUESTS TO 
ADOPT AND AMEND THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 
 
Doug Saba and Michelle Kelly, both members of the Fire Code Review Committee, are also 
members of the Mountain View Fire Protection District. Ron Flax indicated that if these two 
members recused themselves from this agenda item, the committee would not have a quorum 
and could not continue.  With this in mind, the committee openly acknowledged this potential 
for a conflict of interest, and Doug Saba and Michelle Kelly each individually indicated that 
they were able to review this adoption request impartially and without bias. There were no 
objections raised by any other committee members or anyone else participating in the meeting.  
The Committee then proceeded to review the proposed text provided.  The Fire Code Review 
Committee had no questions or comments about this requested code adoption, and all agreed 
that it is a straightforward and clean code adoption without any need for changes.   
 
Motion: Dean Rogers motioned to recommend to the Board of County Commissioners that the 
proposed Mountain View Fire Protection District Fire Code be ACCEPTED for administration 

77



by the district in those portions of unincorporated Boulder County that lie within the boundaries 
of the fire protection district.   
Second: Pat Noyes 
Vote:     Motion approved unanimously  
 
 
 

6. Adjourned 
The meeting was adjourned at 3:46 pm. 
 
 

7. Additional Post Meeting Notes: On June 14, 2023, the Lyons Fire Protection District submitted 
a revised Resolution Adopting and Amending the 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code to 
Ron Flax, Secretary of the Boulder County Fire Code Review Committee.  This document was 
approved on June 8, 2023, by the Board of Directors of the Lyons Fire Protection District.  The 
revised document contains the edits and revisions that were recommended by the Fire Code 
Review Committee and was determined by Ron Flax to meet the intent of the motion for 
approval by the committee.   

 

78



  
 

 
 

 

Claire Levy County Commissioner     Marta Loachamin County Commissioner    Ashley Stolzmann County Commissioner 
 

Community Planning & Permitting 
Courthouse Annex  •  2045 13th Street  •  Boulder, Colorado  80302  •  Tel: 303.441.3930 
Mailing Address:  P.O. Box 471  •  Boulder, Colorado 80306  •  www.bouldercounty.org 
 

Building Safety & Inspection Services  
 

 
BOULDER COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  

PUBLIC HEARING  
DOCKET #FCRC-23-0002 

MOUNTAIN VIEW FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT FIRE CODE  
(2021 IFC) 

 
Thursday, June 22, 2023 @ 9:00 AM 

 
 All commissioners’ public hearings and meetings will be offered in a hybrid 
format where attendees can join through Zoom or in-person at the Boulder 

County Courthouse, 3rd Floor, 1325 Pearl Street, Boulder. There will also be a 
kiosk located in the lobby of the 3rd Floor to sign up for in-person public 

comment. For questions regarding in-person hearings, please email Brianna 
Barber at bbarber@bouldercounty.org or call 303-441-3500. 

 
 

Staff: Ron Flax, Chief Building Official, Deputy Director of Community Planning & 
Permitting – Permits and Licensing, Secretary to the Fire Code Review Committee 
 
The subject of this hearing is acceptance of the proposed Mountain View Fire Protection 
District Fire Code for administration by the Mountain View Fire Protection District. 
 
The Mountain View Fire Protection District provides both fire and emergency medical 
services to portions of eastern Boulder County, western Weld County, and a small portion of 
northern Jefferson County.  The district covers approximately 250 square miles, and in 
addition to the unincorporated areas of Boulder County, Weld County, and Jefferson County 
includes the communities of Erie, Mead, Dacono, Niwot, Eldorado Springs, and the Town of 
Superior.  They provide emergency services to over 90,000 people.   
 
Most of the proposed 2021 IFC adoption accepts the IFC as published by the International 
Code Council.  The previous local amendments which had introduced requirements 
regulating alcoholic beverage production, as well as the cultivation and processing of 
cannabis have been determined by the district to no longer be necessary due to the updates 
of the 2021 IFC as published by the ICC, as well as a lack of development of these 
industries within the district beyond what can be addressed by the code as published.   
 
There are a number of other proposed amendments that appear to be largely clarifying 
administrative provisions and are consistent with past Fire Code Adoptions and regional Fire 
District requirements.   
 
The map attached represents the approximate boundaries of the district.   

79

mailto:bbarber@bouldercounty.org


Staff has the following comments on the proposed fire code adoption: 
 
2021 Edition:  Adopting the latest edition of the Fire Code is strongly encouraged.  The 
Mountain View FPD is currently on the 2018 edition and this update to the 2021 represents 
an important update for the district and will strengthen alignments between the Mountain 
View FPD the surrounding fire districts as well as improving alignments between the district 
and Unincorporated Boulder County.   
 
Review and Recommendations from the Fire Code Review Committee:  On May 23rd, 
the Fire Code Review Committee met and discussed the proposed Mountain View Fire 
Protection District’s proposed text. The committee made no suggestions for edits or 
changes.  The committee voted unanimously to recommend to the Board of County 
Commissioners that the proposed Fire Code be ACCEPTED for administration by the 
district in those portions of unincorporated Boulder County that lie within the boundaries of 
the fire protection district.  
 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION:  Staff recommends that the proposed Mountain View 
Fire Protection District Fire Code be ACCEPTED for administration by the district in those 
portions of unincorporated Boulder County that lie within the boundaries of the fire 
protection district.   
 
 
Attachments: Mountain View FPD Fire Code Adopting Resolution 2023-2 
  Map of Mountain View FDP Tax district Approximate Boundaries. 
  Minutes from the Fire Code Review Committee May 23rd Meeting. 
 

80



Page 1 of 8 
International Fire Code adoption 2022 

Resolution 2023-2
Adopting and Amending the 

2021 Edition of the International Fire Code® 

WHEREAS, the Fire Chief and fire code official have reviewed the International Fire 
Code, 2021 Edition, and recommend the adoption of the same by the Mountain View 
Fire Protection District; and 

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors of the Mountain View Fire Protection District 
deems it necessary and in the best interest of public safety to adopt and enforce the 
codes to establish rules of conduct and standards for protecting life, health, 
property, security, and welfare of the inhabitants and visitors to the District; and 

WHEREAS, the International Fire Code, 2021 Edition, published by the 
International Code Council, is a model code for the regulation and governing of the 
safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the 
storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials, and devices and from 
conditions hazardous to life and property in the occupancy of buildings and 
premises. 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED THAT BY THE BOARD OF 
DIRECTORS OF THE MOUNTAIN VIEW FIRE PROTECTION 
DISTRICT: 

1 Adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code 
1.1  Code Adopted  
The 2021 International Fire Code is adopted in the form including the sections as 
amended including the following appendices: Appendix A, Board of Appeals; 
Appendix B, Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings; Appendix C, Fire Hydrant 
Locations and Distribution; Appendix F, Hazard Ranking; Appendix I, Fire Protection 
Systems – Noncompliant Conditions. 

The date on which this resolution shall take effect shall be the date of approval by 
the governing bodies of each county and municipality whose borders overlap the 
service area of the Mountain View Fire Protection District.  This Code shall be in 
effect within the limits of the Mountain View Fire Protection District. 

Doc ID: a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

81



Page 2 of 8 
International Fire Code adoption 2022 

1.2  Code Described 
The 2021 International Fire Code is published by the International Code Council, 500 
New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001-2070. 

1.3  Copies on File 
At least one copy of the 2021 International Fire Code shall be kept on file in the 
office of the fire code official of the Mountain View Fire Protection District, 3561 
Stagecoach Road, Longmont, Colorado 80504, and may be inspected during regular 
business hours. 

1.4  Purpose 
This code establishes the minimum standards consistent with nationally recognized 
good practice for providing a reasonable level of life safety and property protection 
from the hazards of fire, explosion, and dangerous conditions in new and existing
buildings, structures, and premises, and to provide for the safety of firefighters, and 
emergency responders during emergency operations. 

2 Definitions 
Wherever the term “Board of Directors” is used, it shall be held to mean the Board 
of Directors of the Mountain View Fire Protection District. 

Wherever the word “District” or phrase “Fire District” is used, it shall mean the 
Mountain View Fire Protection District. 

3 Amendments Made in and to the 2021 International 
Fire Code 

The 2021 International Fire Code is amended and changed in the following respects: 

1. Subsection 101.1 is amended to read: 101.1 Title.  These regulations shall 
be known as the Fire Code of the Mountain View Fire Protection District, 
hereinafter referred to as “this code". 

2. A new section 102.13 is added: 102.13 Conflicts with Other Adopted
Codes.  Where a conflict arises between this Code and the International 
Building Code and/or the International Residential Code, the more stringent 
application of the respective codes shall apply. 
Exception: When the Chief Building Official and the Fire Code Official agree 
upon any provision from the respective codes as being applicable and
acceptable.

Doc ID: a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

82



Page 3 of 8 
International Fire Code adoption 2022 

3. A new section 102.14 is added: 102.14 Other Adopted Codes. Where this
document refers to other ICC codes, the currently adopted edition for the 
location under consideration shall apply. 

4. Subsection 103.1 is amended to read: 103.1 Code Compliance Agency. 
The Mountain View Fire Protection District shall be the code compliance 
agency.  The official in charge of the Life Safety Division shall be known as 
the fire code official.  The function of the agency shall be the implementation, 
administration, and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

5. Subsection 104.7 Liability shall be amended by the addition of the following 
sentence at the end of the section: “Nothing herein shall be construed as a 
waiver of any immunities provided by section C.R.S.  24 - 10 - 101, et seq., 
or by other statutes, or by common law.” 

6. Subsection 104.11 Fire investigations shall be amended by the addition of 
the following sentence at the end of the section: “The authority of the Chief 
of the District, or authorize designee, including all fire code officials, to act as 
peace officers shall extend to the limits as authorized in C.R.S. 16-2.5-109.” 

7. Subsection 104.12 Authority at fires and other emergencies shall be 
amended by the addition of the following sentence at the end of the section: 
“the authority of the Chief of the District, or authorized designee, including all 
fire code officials, to act as peace officers shall extend as far as the authority 
set forth in C.R.S. Section 32-1-1002, 16-2.5-109, and other applicable state 
statutes.” 

8. The following subsections are deleted in their entirety: 105.5.1 through 
105.5.3, 105.5.6 through 105.5.9, 105.5.11 through 105.5.31, 105.5.33, 
105.5.35 through 105.5.41, 105.5.43 through 105.5.48, and 105.5.50 
through 105.5.52. 

9. Subsection 105.5.34 is amended to read as follows: 105.5.34 Open 
Burning.  An operational permit is required for the kindling or maintaining of 
an open fire or a fire on any public street alley road or other public or private 
ground. Instructions and stipulations of the permit shall be adhered to.
Exception: No permit shall be required if burning is regulated under the 
regulations promulgated under C.R.S. Section 25-7-123 or regulated by the 
County Health Department. 

10. Subsection 107 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with: 107 Fees.
11. 107.1 Fees.  Fees for services under this code shall be established from time 

to time by resolution of the Board of Directors under Section 32-1-1002(1)(e) 
C.R.S.  Said fees and charges may include a charge for reimbursement to the 
fire district of any consultation fees, expenses or costs incurred by the fire 
district in performing inspection related services under provisions of this code. 

Doc ID: a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

83



Page 4 of 8 
International Fire Code adoption 2022 

107.2 Payment of fees. A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by 
law have been paid; nor shall an amendment to a permit be released until
additional fees, if any, have been paid.  

107.3 Operational permit fee.  An inspection fee may be charged for any
operational permit required by Section 105.5. The inspection fee shall be based
upon the time required to conduct inspections authorized by Section 105.2.2 and
associated activities, to determine compliance with this code and other applicable
laws and ordinances as required by Section 105.2.4, and to issue the permit as 
specified in Section 105.3.7.  

107.4 Construction permit fee.  A fee may be charged for any construction
permit required by Section 105.6 of this code. The construction permit fee is
intended to cover the cost of inspections required or requested in connection with 
the work for which the permit is granted, and the associated costs of processing
the application.  An application shall include an estimate of the total value of the
work, including materials and labor, for which the permit is being sought.  If, in 
the opinion of the fire code official, the valuation is underestimated on the
application, the permit shall be denied, unless written estimates are provided in a
form acceptable to the fire code official, and that support the valuation set forth 
in the application.  Final construction permit valuation shall be set by the fire code
official. 

107.5 Other inspection fee.  Fees for re-inspections, for inspections outside
normal business hours, or for inspections for which no fee is otherwise established 
may be charged.   

107.6 Plan review fee.  The plan review fee is intended to cover the significant 
costs and expenses incurred by the fire district in reviewing materials necessary to
perform appropriate inspections of construction, uses, processes, and operations. 
The fee shall be assessed based on the reasonable, customary, and necessary time
associated with reviewing or evaluating site plans; construction documents and
calculations; changes, additions, or revisions to approved plans; construction
documents resubmitted after the fire code official’s issuing a statement explaining
the reasons that a previous submittal does not conform to the requirements of this
code.  When submittal documents are incomplete or changed and require
additional plan review, an additional plan review fee shall be charged. The plan
review fee required by this Section 107.6 is separate from the construction permit 
fee required by Section 107.4. 

107.7 Unauthorized Work Inspection Fee.  Any person or entity that begins
any work before obtaining a construction permit required by Section 105.6 shall
be subject to an inspection fee in an amount equal to the amount of the
construction permit fee.  The fee shall be separate from and in addition to a 

Doc ID: a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

84



Page 5 of 8 
International Fire Code adoption 2022 

construction permit fee. Payment of the inspection fee shall not relieve any person
from compliance with all other provisions of this code or from any penalty
prescribed by law.  The inspection fee shall be assessed regardless of whether a 
construction permit is then or subsequently issued.   

EXCEPTION: When approved in writing by the fire code official, work may 
begin prior to obtaining a construction permit. 

107.8 Related Fees.  The payment of the fee for construction, uses, processes,
or operations authorized by an operational permit or construction permit shall not
relieve the applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of other fees that
are prescribed by law or required by Section 107. 

12. Subsection 111.1 is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows. 
111.1 Appeals Procedure-General.  Any person, firm, or corporation who are 
grieved by an application, interpretation, or order made by fire district personnel, 
pursuant to any provision of the code for the standards adopted, may file within 
three days a written notice of appeal with the fire district requesting a hearing 
before the Fire Chief.  All appeals must be made in writing to the Fire Chief at 
the district’s administrative office.  The Fire Chief shall establish reasonable rules 
for such appeal and shall make a record of all proceedings.  The decision of the 
Fire Chief shall be considered a final administrative decision. 
111.1.1 Appeals Procedure-Administrative Decisions.  To determine the 
suitability of alternate materials and types of construction and to provide for 
reasonable interpretations of this code, upon request of an interested party, 
including the Fire Chief or designee, there shall be, and is hereby created a 
board of appeals consisting of five members who are qualified by experience and 
training to pass judgment upon pertinent matters.  The board of appeals shall be 
appointed by the Board of Directors and shall hold office at its pleasure.  The 
board of appeals shall adopt reasonable rules of procedure for conducting its 
business, and shall render all interpretations, decisions, and findings in writing to
the appellant or requesting party with a duplicate copy to the Fire Chief.  All 
appeals of the Fire Chief’s decision shall be made in writing, within three days of 
the Fire Chief’s decision, to the Board of Directors by delivery to the district Fire 
Chief or his representative at the district’s administrative office. 
111.1.2 Appeals Board and Procedures.  See Appendix A, as adopted, for 
the makeup and procedures of the Board of Appeals.
13. Subsection 112.4 is amended to read: 112.4 Violation penalties.  Persons 

who violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who shall correct install alter repair or do work in 
violation of the approved construction documents or directions of the fire 
code official or of a permit or certificate used under this code, shall be guilty 
of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than $250.  Each day 

Doc ID: a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

85



Page 6 of 8 
International Fire Code adoption 2022 

that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a
separate offense. 

14. Subsection 113.4 is amended to read: 113.4 Failure to comply.  Any 
person who shall continue any work after having been served a stop work 
order except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a 
violation or unsafe condition shall be liable to a fine and/or imprisonment up 
to the maximum specified in C.R.S. Section 32-1-1001 and C.R.S. section 32-
1-1002.  Each day in which such violation occurs shall constitute a separate 
violation under C.R.S. Section 32-1-1002 (3) (d).

15. Subsection 503.2.9 is added to read: 503.2.9 Driveway Access.  Driveways 
from platted roads to single-family residences shall be sized to meet the 
municipal or county transportation department specifications on straight 
sections.  Inside and outside curve radii will be determined by the fire code 
official to accommodate the fire apparatus expected to respond to the 
residence. 

16. Subsection 507.2.3 is added to read: 507.2.3 In-ground Cisterns.  In-
ground cisterns for fire protection shall be designed, installed, and maintained 
to meet the requirements of the municipal code or county land use code and 
the fire code official.   

17. Subsection 507.2.4 is added to read: 507.2.4 Community Cisterns.  
Where an occupancy is close enough and has adequate access by firefighting 
apparatus, in the opinion of the fire code official, a community cistern may 
provide firefighting water supply, instead of an In-ground Cistern, as 
described in Subsection 503.2.3. 

18. Section 507 of the International Fire Code is amended to add Section 
507.5.3.1 and 507.5.7 to read as follows. 

507.5.3.1. Privately Owned Hydrant Maintenance.  Privately owned 
hydrants shall be maintained at the expense of the private property owner, 
subject to the direction and requirements of the fire code official. Such 
private hydrants shall be flushed and tested periodically according to the Fire 
Code.  In the event such testing reveals that the flow from private hydrants is 
inadequate according to applicable standards, modifications necessary to 
meet these standards shall be ordered by the fire code official and made at 
the expense of the property owner.  All private hydrants shall be painted the 
same color as hydrants on public rights-of-way or elsewhere throughout the 
City with a different color cap, that being white, to designate a private fire 
hydrant. Appropriate markings or signs restricting parking in front of or next 
to fire hydrants shall be designated by the fire code official and implemented 
at the expense of the owner of the property.  No point of connection to any 
private fire hydrant shall be left uncapped without permission of the fire code 
official. 

Doc ID: a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

86



Page 7 of 8 
International Fire Code adoption 2022 

507.5.7 Existing Private Fire Hydrants. Existing hydrants that do not
conform to the Mountain View Fire Protection District specifications or that do 
not face in the direction most consistent with emergency use by the Fire 
Department, as established by the fire code official, shall be changed to meet 
the District’s requirements by the property owner and at the property owner’s 
expense, within fifteen (15) days of service of notice of the required changes 
upon the property owner or its resident agent.  

19. In jurisdictions where single family and two-family residences are not 
required to be sprinklered per the adopted building and residential codes, 
subsection 903.2.8.1 is amended to read: 903.2.8.1 Group R.  An 
automatic sprinkler system installed under Section 903.3.1.3 shall be 
permitted in group R-3 occupancies.  Single family and two-family residences 
are exempt from this requirement where the municipality or county has 
removed this requirement from the adopted building and residential codes. 

20. In jurisdictions where single family or two-family residences are required to 
be sprinkled per the adopted building and residential codes, Subsection 
903.3.1.3 is amended to read as follows: 903.3.1.3 Residential Sprinkler 
Systems.  Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one and two-family 
dwellings, Group R-3, and R-4, condition 1, and townhouses shall be 
permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with the applicable 
jurisdiction’s Building Code, its amendments, and Subsections 903.3.1.3.1 
through 903.3.1.3.3. 

21. Subsection 903.3.1.3.1 is added to read as follows: 903.3.1.3.1 Fire 
Department Connections.  Residential sprinkler systems which are 
supplied by atmospheric pressure tanks and fire pumps shall be installed with 
a Fire Department Connection, the size and location of which shall be 
determined by the fire code official and Section 912. 

22.Subsection 903.3.1.3.2 is added to read as follows: 903.3.1.3.2 Attached
Garage Sprinklers.  Residences with attached garages, where the garage 
may serve as an egress path, shall have the garage sprinkled, as determined 
by the fire code official. 

23. Subsection 903.3.1.3.3 is added to read as follows: 903.3.1.3.3 Interior 
and Exterior Notification.  Residential sprinkler systems shall have 
adequate interior notification of the occupants provided to alert them that the 
sprinkler system is activated, in accordance with NFPA 72.  Additionally, a 
horn and strobe device shall be installed above the Fire Department 
Connection noted in Section 903.3.1.3.1.  Such sprinkler waterflow alarm 
devices shall be activated by the water flow equivalent to the flow of single 
sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system.  Where a fire 
alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall 
actuate the building fire alarm system. 

Doc ID: a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

87



Page 8 of 8 
International Fire Code adoption 2022 

24.Subsection 903.4.2 is amended to read as follows: 903.4.2 Alarms. An
approved audible device, located on the exterior of the building in an
approved location, shall be connected to each automatic sprinkler system. An
approved audible alarm shall be provided in the interior of the building, in a
normally occupied location, to alert building occupants of sprinkler discharge.
Such sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activated by the water flow
equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed
in the system.  Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the
automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system.

25. Section 907 of the International Fire Code is amended to add Section 907.6.7
to read as follows. 907.6.7 Extent of coverage.  The fire code official shall
approve the extent of zone coverage for fire alarm systems in all buildings
and structures.

26. Appendix A is modified to read: Appendix A - Board of Appeals and
Procedures

27. Section A101.3 is amended to read: A101.3 Membership of Board.  The
board shall consist of five voting members appointed by the chief appointing
authority on an ad hoc basis to hear matters that come up for appeal.  The
fire chief shall be the chief appointing authority.  The fire code official shall be
an ex officio member of the board and shall not vote on matters before the
board.

28. Section A101.3.3 is deleted due to the ad hoc makeup of the board.
29. Section A101.3.4 is amended to read: A101.3.4 Chairperson.  The board

shall select one of its members to function as chairperson to hear the matter
brought before the board.

Approved _____February 21_________________________, 2023 by the Board of 
Directors of the Mountain View Fire Protection District. 

__________________________________ 
President – Board of Directors

__________________________________ 
Secretary – Board of Directors 

Doc ID: a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

88



February 21st Meeting Documents

1.17.2023 B...Minutes.pdf and 1 other

a666c3c3505c8902eadba28448964c0224c584a1

MM / DD / YYYY

Signed

02 / 27 / 2023
20:06:01 UTC

Sent for signature to Chad Christian (cchristian@mvfpd.org)

and Cole Lathrop (clathrop@mvfpd.org) from powens@mvfpd.org

IP: 50.235.108.99

02 / 27 / 2023
22:06:55 UTC

Viewed by Cole Lathrop (clathrop@mvfpd.org)

IP: 174.215.23.144

02 / 27 / 2023
22:08:46 UTC

Signed by Cole Lathrop (clathrop@mvfpd.org)

IP: 174.215.23.144

02 / 27 / 2023
22:31:20 UTC

Viewed by Chad Christian (cchristian@mvfpd.org)

IP: 212.102.44.164

02 / 27 / 2023
22:31:38 UTC

Signed by Chad Christian (cchristian@mvfpd.org)

IP: 212.102.44.164

The document has been completed.02 / 27 / 2023
22:31:38 UTC

89



_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

_̂ _̂

_̂

_̂

_̂

36

4

66

52

8

1

93

128

17

31

21
95

T
H

W
C

R
 1

9

W
C

R
 1

3

23

6

56

W
C

R
 2

1

25

27

WCR 38

W
C

R
 3

17TH

WCR 46

15

ST VR
AIN

119

W
C

R
 9

 1
/2

7 5
T

H

W
C

R
 1

5

WCR 2

10

WCR 34

WCR 6

UTE

C
O

LO
R

A
D

O

MINERAL

63
R

D

1S
T

7

2

NELSON

JAY

72

87J

11
5T

H

11
2T

H

68

WCR 28

WCR 26

37
E

WCR 4

2E

4E

WCR 32

10E

19

287

87

23
E

LE
E

 H
ILL

Y
O

R
K

W
C

R
 1

7

10
7T

H

359

LOOKOUT

83

TIPPLE

VALMONT

33
1

OXFORD

SOUTH BOULDER

COAL CREEK CANYON

DIA
G

O
NAL

83
J

27
E

HYGIENE

42

WCR 22

VERMILLION

WCR 18

VISTA

W
C

R
 1

1

79
T

H

83
R

D

WCR 44

LEFTHAND CANYON

6C

FLAGSTAFF

73
R

D

G
A

P

12
0T

H

55
T

H

BIG
 E

LK

WCR 20 1/2

WCR 24

6TH

30
T

H

WCR 16

M
AG

N
O

LI
A

W
C

R
 7

6 5
T

H

LI
N

C
O

LN

ARAPAHOE

BASELINE

WCR 20

IN
D

IA
N

A

FIRESTONE

WCR 14

51
S

T

H
O

LL
Y

10TH

28TH

YELLOWSTONE

E
A

S
T

 C
O

U
N

T
Y

 L
IN

E

11
1T

H

WCR 36

66
T

H

S
IL

V
E

R
 B

IR
C

H

COALTON

10
9T

H

QUAIL

SUGARLOAF

BISO
N

BELLA ROSA

15
A

B
IR

C
H

136TH

C
O

LA
R

D

WCR 10

B
R

O
A

D
W

A
Y

2N
D

O
LD

E
 S

TA
G

E

W
C

R
 5

28
6

MEINING

GRAND VIEW

LINDEN

NIWOT

D
A

K
O

TA
 R

ID
G

E

17 1/2

S
T

O
N

E
 C

A
N

Y
O

N

9TH

25
 F

R
O

N
TA

G
E

59
T

H

G
R

O
S

S
 D

A
M

WOODLAND

MARSHALL

P
IK

A

49
T

H

85

BRUM
M

68
T

H

ROCKY FLATS PLANT

10
4T

H

3RD

76
T

H

G
O

LD
 R

U
N

WCR 46 1/2

RIM

KIOWA

ISABELLE

KNEALE

W
C

R
 1

9 
1/

2

88
T

H

WCR 16 1/2

26
T

H

P
O

N
D

E
R

O
S

A H
ILL

C
H

U
TE

TAPE

5TH

102J

E
A

G
LE

 R
ID

G
E

286D

WCR 8

61
S

T

M
A

IN

57
T

H

A
G

G
R

E
G

A
T

E

15
C

TW
IN

 S
PR

UC
E

82ND

SPRING GULCH

B
L

U
E

 V
IE

W

O
U

R
A

Y

KALMIA

81
S

T

WASATCH

W
C

R
 3

 1
/4

8 7
T

H

PHILLIPS

DISK

69

WCR 12

PEARL

V
A

L
LE

Y

LE
W

IS

E
L

K

JASPER

NEVA

KEN PRATT

NIMBUS

CHERRY

F
O

O
T

H
IL

LS

GRANT

JO
U

R
N

E
Y

THOMAS

S
he

rid
an

ELDORADO

PROSPECT

LO
W

E
LL

PIKE

WCR 42

77
T

H

87
S

BEVERLY

EMPIRE

ERIE

WCR 40

LO
C

U
S

T

GETAWAY

P
A

R
R

IS
H

BULR
USH

P
LA

IN
V

IE
W

C
H

E
R

R
Y

V
A

LE

31
E

MILL

47
T

H

ELM

FLAGG

ROWELL

COAL C
REEK

67

71
S

T

WCR 36 1/2

TW
IN SISTERS

53
R

D

68
J

W
C

R
 1

1-
3

LO
NESTAR

96
T

H

GODDING HOLLOW

PIPIT

30

BILLINGS

49

39
T

H

LONGHORN

W
C

R
 9

 3
/4

B
R

A
IN

A
R

D

RESERVOIR

288B

D
A

V
IS

41
S

T

TRAIL

S
A

N
D

IA

S
T

 V
R

A
IN

 C
A

N
A

L

WCR 34 3/4

O
R

D

OGALLALA

C
T

C

LAKE

VIOLET

P
A

R
K

 L
A

K
E

MAY

ROZENA

TAHOE

D
IS

C

NEBO

SPEEDWAY

WILFRED

F
E

R
N

IRIS

11
9T

H

SHELBY

TIMBER

DYER

W
INIGER GULCH

F
IR

18TH

P
A

R
K

K
IV

A
 R

ID
G

E

U
N

N
A

M
E

D
 S

T
 2144

AIRPORT

WEST COACH

WCR 24 1/2

S
H

E
R

ID
A

N

M
O

S
S

R
O

C
K

A
N

H
A

W
A

321

ZLATEN

B
L

U
E

 M
O

U
N

TA
IN

UPLAND

QUICKSILVER
MAPLE

35
T

H

45T
H

S
TE

A
M

B
O

AT VA
LLE

Y

359F

WCR 26 3/4

PIPER

DRY CREEK

M
C

C
A

S
LI

N

TU
N

N
E

L 19

175TH

IB
M

 P
LA

N
T

A
P

A
C

H
E

JA
DE

176TH

KENOSHA

MALIBU

R
E

D
 G

U
LC

H
INDEPENDENCE

C
O

U
G

A
R

HIGHPLAINS

VESTAL

TH
U

N
D

E
R

F
R

O
N

T
IE

R

A
L

P
IN

E

PLATEAU

TA
B

LE
 M

E
S

A

E
L

M
O

R
E

USCOMBE

KELSO

S
ILV

E
R

 S
A

G
E

B
R

E
H

M

NOTIONS

A
N

C
H

O
R

E
LK

 R
U

N

G
U

N
N

RIVER

CREE

85J

BROOK

IN
D

IA
N

 M
O

U
N

TA
IN

16TH

HIGHLAND

WHALEY

286C

W
A

R
K

G
O

LD
E

N
 A

G
E

E
A

G
LE

W
C

R
 5

 1
/2

E
A

S
T

R
ID

G
E

CARIBOU SPRINGS

PUMA

DOBBINS

67
T

H

M
O

O
R

IN
G

12TH

KESTREL

SALAZAR

69
T

H

CARLSON

21ST

VIRIDIAN

15TH

LEFT FORK

288A

83N

WATERSIDE

4TH

S
E

R
E

N
E

LE
W

IS
 L

A
N

E

ROGERS

HILLCREST

INTERLOCKEN

C
E

N
T

R
A

L

CULVER

FALCON

JENNIE

AZURE

DUSK

APPALOOSA

BEN

S
A

G
A

R

LE
G

A
C

Y

B
A

N
N

E
R

CARBON

DOVE

JUHLS

C
O

P
P

E
R

HEATHER

8E

WOLFF

M
A

LL
A

R
D

MCGREGOR

71
S

T

WCR 40

W
C

R
 7

W
C

R
 7

1ST

ST VRAIN

WCR 20

23

ELM

83
R

D
C

T
C

W
C

R
 1

9

19 4

TIPPLE

25

W
C

R
 1

5

M
ARSHALL

WCR 4

M
A

IN

B
L

U
E

 M
O

U
N

TA
IN

EL
K

66
T

H

EAGLE

WCR 4

OXFORD

55
T

H

WCR 36

61
S

T

11
5T

H
11

5T
H

119

EMPIRE

79T
H

3R
D

28
7

WCR 46

W
C

R
 1

5

WCR 12

2

1ST

DIA
G

O
NAL

WCR 28

W
C

R
 3

PIKE

W
C

R
 1

5

55
T

H

3R
D

W
C

R
 1

7

39
T

H

NIMBUS

W
C

R
 1

1

W
C

R
 1

5

9TH

OXFORD

25 F
R

O
N

TA
G

E

W
C

R
 1

9

96
T

H

6

287

1ST

10

WCR 40

36

95
T

H

LA
K

E

95
T

H

HYGIENE

NIWOT

K
IO

W
A

W
C

R
 7

95
T

H

120TH

U
T

E

WCR 26

49
T

H

PLATEAU

23

WCR 22

MAPLE

W
C

R
 2

1

ST VRAIN
WCR 26

51
S

T

NIWOT

F
O

O
T

H
I L

LS

WCR 42

55
T

H

56

WCR 10

87
T

H

W
C

R
 5

W
C

R
 1

3

WCR 42

B
U

LR
U

S
H

W
C

R
 5

75
T

H

6 6
T

H

61
S

T

11
2T

H

W
C

R
 5

WCR 34

63
R

D

10
7T

H

WCR 32

E
M

P
IR

E

4

WCR 4

286

63RD

W
C

R
 1

1

MEINING

2N
D

W
C

R
 1

7
W

C
R

 1
7

W
C

R
 1

7

W
C

R
 2

1

W
C

R
 1

7

67
T

H

WCR 18

6

WCR 40

HOLLY

WCR 8

W
C

R
 7

P
A

R
R

IS
H

PIKE

119TH

A
P

A
C

H
E

1S
T

WCR 12

3RD

95
T

H

WCR 28

WCR 42

W
C

R
 1

7

WCR 44

WCR 36

MVFR Response Area

Legend

Street_Centerlines_Corrected

_̂ Fire_Stations

MVF_District_2021_Merged_to_one_shapefile

0 2 4 6 81
Miles

90



91



  
 

 
 

 

Claire Levy County Commissioner     Marta Loachamin County Commissioner    Ashley Stolzmann County Commissioner 
 

Community Planning & Permitting 
Courthouse Annex  •  2045 13th Street  •  Boulder, Colorado  80302  •  Tel: 303.441.3930 
Mailing Address:  P.O. Box 471  •  Boulder, Colorado 80306  •  www.bouldercounty.org 
 

Building Safety & Inspection Services  
 

 
BOULDER COUNTY FIRE CODE REVIEW COMMITTEE  

DOCKET #FCRC-23-0002 
PUBLIC HEARING 

 
MOUNTAIN VIEW FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT FIRE CODE  

(2021 IFC) 
 

Tuesday, May 23, 2023 at 3pm 
 
 This Fire Code Review Committee hearings and meeting will be offered in a 
hybrid format where attendees can join through Teams or in-person at the 
Boulder County Courthouse Annex, 2nd Floor, 2045 13th Street, Boulder.  

 
Information regarding how to participate is available on the Fire Code 

Review Committee webpage at https://www.bouldercounty.gov/property-and-
land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-committee/. 

 
 

Staff: Ron Flax, Chief Building Official, Secretary to the Fire Code Review Committee 
 

General Discussion: The Mountain View Fire Protection District provides both fire and 
emergency medical services to portions of eastern Boulder County, western Weld County, 
and a small portion of northern Jefferson County.  The district covers approximately 250 
square miles, and in addition to the unincorporated areas of Boulder County, Weld County, 
and Jefferson County includes the communities of Erie, Mead, Dacono, Niwot, Eldorado 
Springs, and the Town of Superior.  They provide emergency services to over 90,000 
people.   
 
Most of the proposed 2021 IFC adoption accepts the IFC as published by the International 
Code Council.  The previous local amendments which had introduced requirements 
regulating alcoholic beverage production, as well as the cultivation and processing of 
cannabis have been determined by the district to no longer be necessary due to the updates 
of the 2021 IFC as published by the ICC, as well as a lack of development of these 
industries within the district beyond what can be addressed by the code as published.   
 
There are a number of other proposed amendments that appear to be largely clarifying 
administrative provisions and are consistent with past Fire Code Adoptions and regional Fire 
District requirements.   
 
The map attached represents the approximate boundaries of the district.   
 

92



 
2021 Edition:  Adopting the latest edition of the Fire Code is strongly encouraged.  The 
Mountain View FPD is currently on the 2018 edition and this update to the 2021 represents 
an important update for the district and will strengthen alignments between the Mountian 
View FPD the surrounding fire districts as well as improving alignments between the district 
and Unincorporated Boulder County.   
 
 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION:  Staff recommends that the Fire Code Review Committee 
recommend to the Board of County Commissioners that the proposed Mountain View Fire 
Protection District Fire Code be ACCEPTED for administration by the district in those 
portions of unincorporated Boulder County that lie within the boundaries of the fire 
protection district.   
 
 
Attachments: Mountain View FPD Fire Code Adopting Resolution 2023-2 
  Map of Mountain View FDP Tax district Approximate Boundaries. 
 

93



  
 

 
 

 

Claire Levy County Commissioner     Marta Loachamin County Commissioner     Ashley Stolzmann County Commissioner 

Community Planning & Permitting 
Courthouse Annex • 2045 13th Street • Boulder, Colorado 80302 
Mailing Address: P.O. Box 471 • Boulder, Colorado 80306   
303-441-3930 • www.BoulderCounty.gov 
 

MEMO  
 
TO: Curtis Johnson, Boulder County Sheriff  
FROM:  Ron Flax, Chief Building Official   
DATE: May 31, 2023     
RE: Fire Code Review Committee Public Hearing   
  
Request:  Mountain View Fire District requests adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code and 
Amendments 
 
A public hearing of the Boulder County Fire Code Review Committee has been held to consider a 
request by the Mountain View Fire Protection District to adopt the 2021 International Fire Code 
and Amendments.   
The Community Planning & Permitting Department staff and County Commissioners value 
comments from individuals and agencies.  Please check the appropriate response below and submit 
to Ron Flax at rflax@bouldercounty.org or mail to: 
  
 Community Planning & Permitting Department 

Ron Flax, Boulder County Chief Building Official  
 P.O. Box 471 
 Boulder, CO. 80306 
  
Please respond within seven days of the date of this referral.  Late responses will be reviewed as 
the process permits.  All comments will be made part of the public record and given to the 
applicant.   
Only a portion of the submitted documents may have been enclosed.  If you would like additional 
information, you are welcome to review the entire file on our Fire Code Review Committee website 
at https://bouldercounty.gov/property-and-land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-
committee/#:~:text=The%20Fire%20Code%20Review%20Committee,districts%20to%20enforce%2
0these%20codes. 
If you have any questions regarding this application, please contact me at 720-564-2643. 
 
Thank you, 
Ron Flax, Boulder County Chief Building Official 
 
Please return responses to the above address by DATE 
__X__ We have reviewed the proposal and have no conflicts. 
_____ Letter is enclosed. 
 
Signed________________________________    
Printed Name__Curtis Johnson_____________     
 
Agency or Address __Boulder County Sheriff_________________________ 

94

mailto:rflax@bouldercounty.org
https://bouldercounty.gov/property-and-land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-committee/#:%7E:text=The%20Fire%20Code%20Review%20Committee,districts%20to%20enforce%20these%20codes
https://bouldercounty.gov/property-and-land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-committee/#:%7E:text=The%20Fire%20Code%20Review%20Committee,districts%20to%20enforce%20these%20codes
https://bouldercounty.gov/property-and-land/land-use/building/fire-code-review-committee/#:%7E:text=The%20Fire%20Code%20Review%20Committee,districts%20to%20enforce%20these%20codes


95



From: Flax, Ron
To: Gissel, Kathy
Subject: Mountain View Fire - 2021 Fire code adoption - public feedback
Date: Tuesday, June 13, 2023 4:02:31 PM

-----Original Message-----
From: JANET Robinson <granitejanet@msn.com>
Sent: Friday, June 09, 2023 8:44 PM
To: Flax, Ron <rflax@bouldercounty.org>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] 2021 Fire code

Hi Ron,
Just emailing my support for the adoption of the 2021 Fir Code for Mt View fire dept, which covers my home. I 
would love to see no open burning whatsoever but I guess this is a start.
I’d also like to see no fireworks stands west of highway 93, such as the one that shows up every July on the corner 
of highway 93 and 170, it’s so upsetting to see that at the same spot at the start of the Marshall fire, did our County 
leaders  not learn anything ?

Thanks,
Janet Robinson

96

mailto:rflax@bouldercounty.org
mailto:kgissel@bouldercounty.org

	Hearing Packet Cover Sheet
	Binder1
	1 Resolution 2023-039
	2 By-Laws - Updated 5-23-23
	3 BOCC Hearing - Staff Recommendation - Lyons FPD - FCRC-23-0001
	4 Adoption Resolution to the 2021 IFC 06.08.2023
	5 Lyons FPD Map
	6 Staff Recommendation - Lyons FPD - FCRC-23-0001
	7 Confirmation Letter - Adjusted Amendment to the 2021 IFC 6-8-23
	8 Lyons FCRC Referral - Sheriff Signed
	9 Lyons FCRC Referral - FFA Signed
	10 Lyons and Mtn View Minutes - 5-23-2023 (DRAFT)
	11 BOCC Hearing - Staff Recommendation - Mountain View FPD - FCRC-23-0002
	12 Signed adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code 20230221
	13 Mountain View Fire District Map
	14 Mountain View Fire Combined District Map
	15 Staff Recommendation - Mountain View FPD - FCRC-23-0002
	16 Mountain View FCRC Referral - Sheriff Signed
	17 Mountain View FCRC Referral - FFA Signed
	18 Mountain View Fire - public feedback


