
From: Roberts, Grant
To: Bashford-Page, Dawn; Farineau, Ramona; Nuoci, Brittany; Sweet, Cody; Trabucco, Joe; Baca, Ashley; Gabriel,

Courtney
Cc: Dieterich, Jillian; Golden, Melissa
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
Date: Wednesday, November 8, 2023 10:49:55 AM

All these vehicles are still in service and being used by the departments except for Ford escape
#1913, it was recently rearended is not drivable. We were asked to wait for replacement vehicles to
arrive before we sold the totaled units because of the departmental needs. This is why we don’t yet
have the salvage amounts. It would put the coroner’s office and HHS in a bind without these vehicles
for an extended period of time. Please advise how we want to move forward with this.
 
Thanks.
 
Grant
 

From: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 8, 2023 10:26 AM
To: Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov>; Farineau, Ramona
<rfarineau@bouldercounty.gov>; Nuoci, Brittany <bnuoci@bouldercounty.gov>; Sweet, Cody
<csweet@bouldercounty.gov>; Trabucco, Joe <jtrabucco@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley
<abaca@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Dieterich, Jillian <jdieterich@bouldercounty.gov>; Golden, Melissa
<mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
Question about the salvage of the vehicles. I’m not sure who would have this information.
 
I’m looking for the salvage amounts that we have gotten for each vehicle, as that will need to be
applied towards the purchase of the new vehicles.
 
Thanks so much!
Dawn  
 
Dawn Bashford-Page
Budget Analyst
Boulder County Office of Financial Management
2020 13th St.
Boulder CO 80302
303-441-1749
Email: dpage@bouldercounty.gov
 
New: Boulder County has a new website: BoulderCounty.gov! Bookmark it today. Email addresses will
transition at a later date.
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From: Bashford-Page, Dawn 
Sent: Monday, November 6, 2023 3:28 PM
To: Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov>; Farineau, Ramona
<rfarineau@bouldercounty.gov>; Nuoci, Brittany <bnuoci@bouldercounty.gov>; Sweet, Cody
<csweet@bouldercounty.gov>; Trabucco, Joe <jtrabucco@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley
<abaca@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Dieterich, Jillian <jdieterich@bouldercounty.gov>; Golden, Melissa
<mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
Great information – thanks for that! I will add that to my spreadsheet for backup.
 
Dawn Bashford-Page
Budget Analyst
Boulder County Office of Financial Management
2020 13th St.
Boulder CO 80302
303-441-1749
Email: dpage@bouldercounty.gov
 
New: Boulder County has a new website: BoulderCounty.gov! Bookmark it today. Email addresses will
transition at a later date.
 
 

From: Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov> 
Sent: Monday, November 6, 2023 3:11 PM
To: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov>; Farineau, Ramona
<rfarineau@bouldercounty.gov>; Nuoci, Brittany <bnuoci@bouldercounty.gov>; Sweet, Cody
<csweet@bouldercounty.gov>; Trabucco, Joe <jtrabucco@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley
<abaca@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Dieterich, Jillian <jdieterich@bouldercounty.gov>; Golden, Melissa
<mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
My figures are matching. I do want to point out that the main reason for the price increases is EV v/s
Gas. We are now being directed to buy everything EV when applicable and new suitable EV models
have become available to since September.
 
I am hoping to have the quote from AvTech tomorrow, I will send It as soon as I get it.
 
Thanks
 
Grant
 

From: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov> 
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Sent: Monday, November 6, 2023 2:13 PM
To: Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov>; Farineau, Ramona
<rfarineau@bouldercounty.gov>; Nuoci, Brittany <bnuoci@bouldercounty.gov>; Sweet, Cody
<csweet@bouldercounty.gov>; Trabucco, Joe <jtrabucco@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley
<abaca@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Dieterich, Jillian <jdieterich@bouldercounty.gov>; Golden, Melissa
<mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
Thanks for the information! I’ve added Melissa Golden on this email string as well since she works
with Fleet.
 
I have attached a spreadsheet to track the requests.
 
When do you believe you will see the quote for the Avtech upfit? As soon as I have that I can
proceed with the amendment.
 
Grant – are your figures matching my figures so far?
Dawn
 
Dawn Bashford-Page
Budget Analyst
Boulder County Office of Financial Management
2020 13th St.
Boulder CO 80302
303-441-1749
Email: dpage@bouldercounty.gov
 
New: Boulder County has a new website: BoulderCounty.gov! Bookmark it today. Email addresses will
transition at a later date.
 
 

From: Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov> 
Sent: Monday, November 6, 2023 1:29 PM
To: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov>; Farineau, Ramona
<rfarineau@bouldercounty.gov>; Nuoci, Brittany <bnuoci@bouldercounty.gov>; Sweet, Cody
<csweet@bouldercounty.gov>; Trabucco, Joe <jtrabucco@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley
<abaca@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Dieterich, Jillian <jdieterich@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
All,
 
I have attached the quotes for the vehicle that got totaled.
 
Unit #2164 will be replaced with a Chrysler Pacifica PHEV                  Total $52,185.00
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Unit #1913 will be replaced with a Chevy Blazer EV                              Total $54,575.00
Unit #2159 will be replaced with a Chevy Blazer EV                             Total $54,575.00
Unit #2165 will be replaced with a Chrysler Pacifica PHEV                  Total $52,185.00         
Unit #2157 will be replaced with a Chrysler Pacifica PHEV                   Total $52,185.00
Unit #0078 will be replaced with a Chevy Blazer EV                                Total $54,575.00
Unit #0090 will be replaced with a Chevy Silverado 2500 4x4, extended cab, long bed, pickup truck.
*This unit needs a topper, and to be upfitted with red and blue emergency lighting and siren. lighting
quote provided from AvTECH electronics. The topper quote provided by s cargo in Loveland.
Cost for truck is                                                $50,953.00
Cost for Topper is                                             $4275.00
Estimated Cost for Avtech upfit is              $8500.00
Estimated Total cost for this unit is          $63728.00
 
Once I get the cost from AvTech I will pass it along.
 
Thanks
 
Grant
 
 

From: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov> 
Sent: Monday, November 6, 2023 10:06 AM
To: Farineau, Ramona <rfarineau@bouldercounty.gov>; Roberts, Grant
<groberts@bouldercounty.gov>; Nuoci, Brittany <bnuoci@bouldercounty.gov>; Sweet, Cody
<csweet@bouldercounty.gov>; Trabucco, Joe <jtrabucco@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley
<abaca@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Dieterich, Jillian <jdieterich@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: FW: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
Here is the last email that I sent out. Please forward the rest of the needed information and I’ll get
the amendment complete.
 
Dawn Bashford-Page
Budget Analyst
Boulder County Office of Financial Management
2020 13th St.
Boulder CO 80302
303-441-1749
Email: dpage@bouldercounty.gov
 
New: Boulder County has a new website: BoulderCounty.gov! Bookmark it today. Email addresses will
transition at a later date.
 
 

From: Bashford-Page, Dawn 
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Sent: Tuesday, September 19, 2023 11:02 AM
To: Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley <abaca@bouldercounty.gov>;
Leadens, Nicole <nleadens@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Golden, Melissa <mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
Good morning,
 
Here’s an update on where we are on this amendment.
 
Here’s what I will need to complete the amendment.
 

All paperwork with the amounts of the damaged vehicles so we have that as backup for the
requests. Recd 9/11/23
All purchase order paperwork to backup the amounts you are requesting.
A memo explaining what happened. Recd 9/11/23
A list of each new vehicle replacement and its requested amount. Recd 4 out of 7. 11/6/23
The account to be used for these is 101.31023.77030.CAP2.
Any other information that you believe should be included in this amendment.

 
Have a great day!
Dawn
 
Dawn Bashford-Page
Budget Analyst
Boulder County Office of Financial Management
2020 13th St.
Boulder CO 80302
303-441-1749
Email: dpage@bouldercounty.gov
 
New: Boulder County has a new website: BoulderCounty.gov! Bookmark it today. Email addresses will
transition at a later date.
 
 

From: Bashford-Page, Dawn 
Sent: Tuesday, August 29, 2023 1:20 PM
To: Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley <abaca@bouldercounty.gov>;
Leadens, Nicole <nleadens@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Golden, Melissa <mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
Thank you!
 
Dawn Bashford-Page
Budget Analyst
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Boulder County Office of Financial Management
2020 13th St.
Boulder CO 80302
303-441-1749
Email: dpage@bouldercounty.gov
 
New: Boulder County has a new website: BoulderCounty.gov! Bookmark it today. Email addresses will
transition at a later date.
 
 

From: Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, August 29, 2023 1:13 PM
To: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley <abaca@bouldercounty.gov>;
Leadens, Nicole <nleadens@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Golden, Melissa <mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
I will get all these quoted and follow up ASAP
 
Thanks
 
Grant
 

From: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, August 29, 2023 1:08 PM
To: Baca, Ashley <abaca@bouldercounty.gov>; Leadens, Nicole <nleadens@bouldercounty.gov>;
Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>; Roberts, Grant <groberts@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Golden, Melissa <mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
That’s great! Thank you!
 
Dawn Bashford-Page
Budget Analyst
Boulder County Office of Financial Management
2020 13th St.
Boulder CO 80302
303-441-1749
Email: dpage@bouldercounty.gov
 
New: Boulder County has a new website: BoulderCounty.gov! Bookmark it today. Email addresses will
transition at a later date.
 
 

From: Baca, Ashley <abaca@bouldercounty.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, August 29, 2023 12:47 PM
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To: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov>; Leadens, Nicole
<nleadens@bouldercounty.gov>; Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>; Roberts, Grant
<groberts@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Golden, Melissa <mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: RE: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
Hi Dawn,
 
I’m looping in Grant into this email as he will be the one who is working on the vehicle replacements
for these. So the fourth bullet point would be in his wheelhouse.

My team should be able to get the first three.
 
Thank you,
Ashley Baca, CIC, CRM
Risk Manager
Boulder County Risk Management
Phone: 303.441.3872
abaca@bouldercounty.org
 
Risk & Safety
 
CAUTION: This email message and/or attachments from the Boulder County Attorney’s Office may
contain information that is privileged, confidential, and exempt from disclosure under applicable
law.  If you are not the intended recipient (or authorized to act on behalf of the intended recipient)
of this message, you may not disclose, forward, distribute, copy, or use this message or its contents. 
If you have received this communication in error please notify the sender immediately by return
email and delete the original message from your email system. 
 
 
 

From: Bashford-Page, Dawn <dpage@bouldercounty.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, August 29, 2023 10:06 AM
To: Leadens, Nicole <nleadens@bouldercounty.gov>; Baca, Ashley <abaca@bouldercounty.gov>;
Gabriel, Courtney <cgabriel@bouldercounty.gov>
Cc: Golden, Melissa <mgolden@bouldercounty.gov>
Subject: May Hail totaled vehicles
 
Good morning,
 
Just letting you know; I have been asked to take the lead to get this amendment in place for the
vehicles totaled in the May hail storm.
 
Here’s what I will need to complete the amendment.
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All paperwork with the amounts of the damaged vehicles so we have that as backup for the
requests. Recd 9/11/23
All purchase order paperwork to backup the amounts you are requesting.
A memo explaining what happened. Recd 9/11/23
A list of each new vehicle replacement and its requested amount.
The account to be used for these is 101.31023.77030.CAP2.
Any other information that you believe should be included in this amendment.

 
As is always the case, as we are working on this, we may need more information as time goes by.
 
Thanks so much!
Dawn

 
 
Dawn Bashford-Page
Budget Analyst
Boulder County Office of Financial Management
2020 13th St.
Boulder CO 80302
303-441-1749
Email: dpage@bouldercounty.gov
 
New: Boulder County has a new website: BoulderCounty.gov! Bookmark it today. Email addresses will
transition at a later date.
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